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San Francisco, CA. Nixon Peabody LLP is proud to announce that partner Matthew Richards 
was named Pro Bono Lawyer of the Year by Chambers USA during its virtual awards ceremony. 

Based in the firm’s San Francisco office, Matt oversees Nixon Peabody’s award-winning pro 
bono program, which leverages the skills and experience of attorneys and professional 
colleagues to make a positive impact for the firm’s clients and communities.  

“Nixon Peabody’s dedication to making a difference in the lives of those who need it most is 
unwavering,” said Stephen Zubiago, CEO and managing partner of Nixon Peabody. “Matt is 
a fierce advocate for those in need, spearheading our pro bono efforts and devoting his time 
to support his local and global communities. We congratulate him on this tremendous 
honor.” 

Nixon Peabody’s pro bono program focuses on serving the most vulnerable and marginalized 
communities in our society. Attorneys throughout the firm participate in a variety of projects 
that move the needle forward on equality and justice for all. Matt’s own work includes guiding 
refugees from Afghanistan and Ukraine through immigration asylum and humanitarian 
parole; working with Human Rights Watch to help the organization uncover human rights 
abuses by representing them in Freedom of Information Act requests and related litigation; 
and working with the Bay Area Host Committee to bring major sporting events to the San 
Francisco Bay Area, including developing community empowerment and legacy initiatives 
associated with three major global sporting events in the Bay: the 2025 NBA All-Star Game, 
Super Bowl LX, and the 2026 FIFA World Cup. Learn more about Nixon Peabody’s Pro Bono & 
Social Impact initiatives. 
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In addition to leading the firm’s pro bono program, Matt is a member of the Construction & 
Real Estate Litigation practice. He counsels owners and general contractors and represents 
them in federal and state court construction litigation and in arbitration. Matt also has 
significant experience in antitrust, bankruptcy, and appellate law. 

The Chambers USA Awards honor top law firms and individuals for their outstanding legal 
work and expertise, impressive strategic growth and innovation, and unparalleled excellence 
in client service delivery.  
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